

A-1473 / tk

LEASE

THIS **LEASE** (the "Lease") made by and between the **CITY OF ATLANTIC CITY**, a Municipal Corporation of the State of New Jersey, c/o City Solicitor's Office, Room 707, City Hall, 1301 Bacharach Boulevard, Atlantic City, New Jersey 08401 (hereinafter referred to as the "Landlord"; and **SHORE MANAGEMENT GROUP, INC.**, located at PO Box 1923, Atlantic City, New Jersey 08404 (hereinafter referred to as the "Tenant");

WITNESSETH

THAT, the Landlord does hereby lease to the Tenant and the Tenant does hereby rent from the Landlord, a certain portion of the Beach in Atlantic City, New Jersey shown as **Beach Lot(s) #23** on the attached Beach Lot Map prepared by the City Engineer revised May 13, 2016, and generally described as that area of the Atlantic City Beach lying between **Mid Bellevue Avenue to Georgia Avenue (LOT 23)** from the southerly boundary of the Atlantic City Boardwalk to the Mean High Water line of the Beach ("Leased Beach" or "Premises");

For a term of **FOUR (4) years**, commencing on **May 1, 2025**, and ending on **December 31, 2028**, to be used and occupied for the purposes set forth herein and other lawful purposes not in contravention of the terms of this Lease.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing premises and the mutual promises hereinafter contained, it is agreed by and between the parties as follows:

1. Rent. The Tenant covenants and agrees to pay to the Landlord, as rent for and during the term hereof, the sum of **\$4,000.00** as discussed (\$1,000.00 per year) (the "Rent") per year upon Tenant's execution of this Lease Agreement. Rent shall be due and payable to the Office of Revenue & Finance, City Hall - Room 306, Atlantic City, NJ 08401, by May 1st of each year in the following manner:

\$1,000.00 received by Landlord at Auction 4/3/2025

\$0.00 due upon execution of Lease Agreement

\$1,000.00 due on or before May 1, 2026

\$1,000.00 due on or before May 1, 2027

\$1,000.00 due on or before May 1, 2028

2. Late Payments/Default. If the Tenant fails to make any payment by the time provided herein, Tenant agrees to pay to Landlord a late charge of 5% of the payment. If the Landlord has

not received the rental payment or late fee within thirty (30) days of its due date or assessment, the Tenant shall be in default.

3. Use of Rental Concession Under Initial Rental Fee. This Lease shall entitle the Tenant to the use of the Leased Beach as described herein. However, the Tenant's possession of the Leased Beach, shall be non-exclusive except with respect to the "Restricted Areas" (as hereinafter defined) and as otherwise set forth in this Lease. Tenant shall at all times afford reasonably convenient public access to the water and beach within the Leased Beach. Storage sheds shall be built in place, uniform in size and shape, dimensions to be approved by the Director of Licensing & Inspections and all other construction types including trailer sheds will be prohibited except for use by beach bars. During severe weather events, additional tie-down straps are to be installed. In addition to the uses permitted, at Tenant's option, pursuant to paragraph 4 of this Lease, Tenant may use the Leased Beach for rentals of equipment, construction of facilities, and the provision of services related to the public's use and enjoyment of the beach and ocean, which shall be limited to: a) rentals of beach chairs, cabanas, umbrellas and towels, and b) construction and maintenance of facilities and amenities including without limitation outdoor showers, storage/administrative sheds decking, and cabanas, which are subject approvals by land use departments of the Casino Reinvestment Development Authority (CRDA), NJDEP and the City of Atlantic City ("City") when applicable. The sale of food, beverages or merchandise is prohibited except as allowed under paragraph 4; and the City expressly reserves the air rights and the right to use or approve of the use of the air rights of the leased areas. The City further reserves the right to use or approve of the use of the areas between the dunes and the Boardwalk for other use.

4. Sales of Food and Beverages. As permitted by Atlantic City Code Section 92-7, the Tenant shall have the option, exercisable annually, to elect to serve food and alcoholic beverages, within the Leased Beach either with a service structure or structures on the beach ("Option A") or service without a service structure on the beach but delivered from a licensed premises not located on the beach to the Leased Beach ("Option B") (collectively, the "Option") subject to the following:

a. Tenant must provide the Landlord with written notice of Tenant's intent to exercise the Option and must pay Landlord the appropriate Option Fee (as hereinafter defined) prior to the service of any food or beverage.

Should Tenant fail to exercise "Option A" or "Option B" in any year then this lease agreement shall be terminated and have no further effect. By written notice, Tenant shall advise the Landlord annually by February 1st of each year as to whether either Option A or B has been elected.

b. Tenant, at the time of the Option, must provide Landlord with proof of an insurance policy issued by an insurance company licensed to do business in the State of New Jersey insuring the Tenant and the City of Atlantic City and New Jersey Department of Environmental Protection (NJ-DEP). See section 1.1 for insurance requirements.

c. Tenant must submit a security plan for Tenant's food and beverage operation (the "Security Plan") for approval by the Atlantic City Police Department, Alcoholic Beverage Control Unit. For Option A, the Security Plan shall, without limitation, provide for at least one special detail Atlantic City police officer to be stationed on the Boardwalk and/or ramp adjacent to the Leased Beach between 10:00 p.m. and closing on any night when alcoholic beverages are served past 10:00 p.m. This requirement may be amended, as necessary in the interest of public safety, by the Chief of Police. The Security Plan must be approved by the Atlantic City Police Department prior to the commencement of any food and beverage operation.

d. Tenant is required to amend its Security Plan upon the following conditions, (1) change in hours of operation; (2) the scheduling of a major entertainment event outside of the immediate food and beverage operation area; (3) any increase of 10% or greater of the square footage of food and beverage operation area; or (4) for any significant change in the operation of food and beverage sales that, in the opinion of the Chief of Police, requires an amendment to the Security Plan;

e. Tenant must at the time of exercising each Option be the holder of a valid retail alcoholic beverage license, permit issued by the City of Atlantic City or State of New Jersey or a Casino Hotel Alcoholic Beverage ("CHAB") license issued by the Division of Gaming Enforcement (collectively referred to as an "alcoholic beverage license");

Only Tenants owning (or leasing within) a facility with a valid retail or alcohol beverage license that lies within the beach block may exercise the Options; and

f. The area of the Leased Beach in which food and beverage sales may occur shall be limited to the Leased Beach that is directly south of, or contiguous to, the facility owned or leased by the Tenant together with any beach area to which Tenant also holds a lease and that is directly contiguous to the Leased Beach (the collective area of Permitted Area and contiguous Leased Beach shall be shown as the "Licensed Area");

g. Under Option A. Food and beverages may be served by Tenants in the Licensed Area from 8:00 a.m. to 3:00 a.m. daily. The Licensed Area must be closed to the public with all food and beverage personnel exited from by 4:00 a.m. Security and maintenance personnel may remain after 4:00 a.m. to secure, clean and maintain the Licensed Area. Under Option B. Food and beverage, including alcoholic beverages, may be served on the Leased Beach from 10:00a.m. to 6:00 p.m. daily. Notwithstanding the above, the Mayor may extend the hours of operation for all beach food and beverage operations.

In the event of a declared national or state emergency, Landlord may or suspend any food or beverage operation in the interest of public safety.

h. Under Option A. The operator of the Licensed Area must provide and maintain restrooms that are open to the public during all hours of operation.

i. Only under Option A. Entertainment, including live entertainment, shall be permitted within the Licensed Area at any time during the hours of food and beverage operation.

j. Tenant's utilization of the Leased Beach for the sale of food and beverage shall be conditioned upon the Tenant obtaining all required approvals of all government entities with jurisdiction over such sales.

k. The annual Option Fee may be paid to Landlord at any time during a Lease Year but before any service of food or beverages. The Option Fee for Option A. shall be calculated based on the following formula:

l. Option A. An annual fee of \$30,000 (base fee – (base fee shall increase 3% per year), to serve food and beverages, both alcoholic & non-alcoholic from an establishment on the beach, whether temporary, mobile or permanent, plus

a. An Additional Fee, equal to the product of the amount of square footage of the decking, whether mobile, temporary or permanent, for any beach bar area inclusive of the bar, entertainment and other operational areas, but exclusive of the public restroom facilities and showers ("Structured Area") times two (\$2.00) dollars for any portion of the Structured Area as allowed by State and local rules and regulations.

m. Option B. An annual fee of \$15,000.00 (base fee - (base fee shall increase 3% per year)) for an operation from which food beverages, including alcoholic beverages are only delivered to patrons on the Leased Beach from a qualified food and beverage retailer, but without any physical structure or servicing area for food or beverage operations on the Leased Beach provided, however, that such services shall only be permitted between the hours of 10:00 a.m. and 6:00 p.m., and further provided that any such delivery-only service operation shall not be required to construct or maintain restroom facilities within the Leased Beach.

n. All tenants exercising Option A may also operate pursuant to provisions governing Option B.

5. Restricted Areas. Pursuant to Paragraph 3 above, all areas of the Leased Beach except for those specifically delineated as restricted must be open to the public. Areas of the Leased Beach that may, in the tenants determination and with City approval, and when required by law or by the terms of Alcoholic Beverage License, be restricted from the public or from members thereof (the "Restricted Areas") are: (1) under Option A, the area of any food and beverage operation, or any part thereof, including, but not limited to, the area of any bar operation, storage or administrative facility, or table service area; (2) entertainment staging or viewing area; (3) reserved cabana area and reserved chairs provided by Tenant; (areas reserved by hotel quests) and (4)

general storage and/or administration sheds. **Notwithstanding the above, no Restricted Area or combination of Restricted Areas, shall prevent access from the Boardwalk to the ocean, nor shall any Restricted Area(s) prevent access to or across (east and west) the public bench south of the Leased Beach. All restricted areas shall be located and established in accordance with NJDEP Land Use Regulation Program Coastal General Permit conditions and all subsequent Condition Compliance Letters.** Unless otherwise permitted by permit issued by the NJDEP, all structures within the Leased Beach shall not be erected until May 1st and shall be removed by October 31st at the Tenant's expense unless otherwise amended by the Landlord and approved by the NJDEP.

6. Assignment/Subletting. This Lease may not be assigned by Tenant without the express written consent of Landlord. Tenant, with approval from Landlord, may sublease all or any portion of the Leased Beach (the "Sublease"). Any such Sublease shall provide that: (1) Tenant shall remain primarily liable to Landlord for all obligations under this Lease, and (2) In addition to the Tenant's primary responsibility, the Subtenant shall be responsible for all of the obligations under this Lease as if named the Tenant therein.

a. Sublease of Food and Beverage: Upon approval by the City, this Lease specifically allows the Subtenant to conduct any food and beverage operation under the Options permitted in this Lease, provided, however, that the Option first be exercised by the Tenant who must be eligible under the requirements of Paragraph 4, above.

b. Sublease of other Permitted Activities: Tenant must obtain Landlord's written consent to sub-lease, assign or partner, with another individual or entity, for all or any parts of their lease.

c. Fee for Subletting: If Tenant subleases the Premises or any part(s) thereof, Tenant shall be liable to the Landlord for an additional Subletting Fee in an amount equal to one half of the amount by which the total sublease payments to be paid to Tenant by its Subtenant(s) exceed the combined Rent and Option Fee paid by Tenant to Landlord for the Premises in that Lease Year.

Notwithstanding any provisions of this Lease, Subtenants shall be required to comply with all licensing and other requirements under New Jersey law or local ordinance of this lease.

7. Inspection of Premises. The Tenant has examined the Leased Beach and has entered into this Lease without any representation on the part of the Landlord as to the condition thereof. The Tenant shall neither encumber nor obstruct the street ends, ramps, fire hydrants or stairs on or adjoining the Leased Beach, and shall keep and maintain the Leased Beach in a clean condition, free from debris, trash and refuse. Dilapidated chairs or umbrellas shall not be permitted.

8. Signage. Except for operational signage and subject to N.J.A.C 7:36-25.12, the Tenant shall not place nor allow to be placed any signs of any kind, upon, in or about the Leased Beach or any part thereof, without the approval of the Land Use Department of the Casino Reinvestment Development Authority. In case the Landlord or the Landlord's agents, employees or representatives shall deem it necessary to remove any such signs in order to paint or make any repairs, alterations or improvements in or upon the Leased Beach or any part thereof, they may be so removed, but shall be replaced at the Landlord's expense when the said repairs, alterations or improvements shall have been completed.

9. Compliance with Laws and Regulations. The Tenant shall promptly comply with all applicable State and Federal statutes and local ordinances, rules and regulations affecting the Leased Beach, their use, operation and maintenance, and for the correction, prevention, and abatement of nuisances, violations or other grievances in, upon or connected with the Leased Beach, during the term hereof. Tenant shall also promptly comply with all orders, regulations, requirements and directives of the Board of Fire Underwriters or similar authority and of any insurance companies which have issued or are about to issue policies of insurance covering the Leased Beach and its contents, for the prevention of fire or other casualty, damage or injury, at the Tenant's own cost and expense. However, any provisions of this Lease specifically permitting activities on the Beach, including, but not limited to the sales of food and beverage and the provision of entertainment, shall supersede any provisions of the Special Events section of the Municipal Code, Chapter 21-1, et seq, and therefore obviate the requirement to obtain a Special Events Permit for activities specifically provided for herein.

10. Tenant's Indemnification. The Tenant agrees to and shall save, keep and hold harmless, defend and indemnify the Landlord and NJDEP from and for any and all payments, expenses, costs, or attorney fees and from and for any and all claims and liability for losses or damage to property or injuries to persons occasioned wholly or in part by or resulting from any use of the Leased Beach or any acts or omissions by the Tenant or the Tenant's agents, employees, guests,

licensees, invitees, subtenants, assignees or successors, special detail officers hired by the Tenant, or for any cause or reason whatsoever arising out of or by reason of the occupancy by the Tenant and/or the conduct of the Tenant's business unless resulting from the sole negligence of the additional insured. It is the intention of this indemnity agreement on the part of the Landlord and NJDEP, as a condition of this Lease, that, except for claims caused by Landlord's or NJDEP's intentional acts or omissions, it shall be full and total indemnification against any kind or character of claim whatsoever that may be asserted against the City and NJDEP by reasons of, or as a consequence of having entered into this Lease.

11. Tenant Insurance. Before occupying the leased premises, the Tenant shall purchase and maintain insurance, in conformance with the provisions contained in this Section. This insurance will provide a defense and indemnify the City of Atlantic City (City) and the New Jersey Department of Environmental Protection (NJDEP) against any such claim, damage, loss or expense that is attributable to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or to injury to or destruction of tangible property including the loss of use, which arises out of the Tenant's operations under this Lease. This insurance shall apply regardless of whether the operations, actions, derelictions or failures to act from which the claim arises, are attributable to; (1) the Tenant, any of its consultants, officers, agents, subcontractors, employees, or anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of them including anyone for whose acts of the aforementioned may be liable by operation of statute, government regulation, or applicable case law or; (2) the City and/or NJDEP, unless caused by the sole negligence of the City and/or NJDEP.

Proof of this insurance shall be provided to the City before the leased premises are occupied. In no event shall the failure to provide this proof, prior to the commencement of the work, be deemed a waiver by the City of the Tenant's insurance obligations set forth herein. In the event that the insurance company (ies) issuing the policy (ies) required by this section deny coverage to the City and/or NJDEP, the Tenant will defend and indemnify the City and/or the NJDEP at the Tenant's expense.

Minimum of Liability

The Tenant shall obtain the required insurance with the carrier rated A- VII or better by A.M. Best. The Tenant shall maintain at least the limits of liability as set forth below:

Commercial General Liability Insurance

\$ 1,000,000 Each Occurrence Limit (Bodily Injury and Property Damage)

\$ 2,000,000 General Aggregate

\$ 2,000,000 Product/Completed Operations Aggregate

\$ 1,000,000 Personal and Advertising Injury Limit.

Contractual Liability that will respond to indemnification clause included in the contract shall be included in the policy. If the Tenant has more than one (1) location covered by this policy, the "Designated Location(s) General Aggregate Limit" endorsement, referencing the location in this Lease shall be included in the policy. In the alternative the Tenant may provide a Commercial General Liability policy with no General Aggregate. If any athletic events are conducted on the leased premises, coverage shall include liability for injury to participants.

Liquor Liability Insurance (Only applies if alcohol is sold or served)

\$ 1,000,000 Per Occurrence & Aggregate

Automobile Liability Insurance

\$ 1,000,000 Combined Single Limit Bodily Injury and Property Damage.

Coverage must include all owned, non-owned and hired vehicles used by the Contractor.

Workers' Compensation and Employers' Liability Insurance

\$ 500,000 Each Accident

\$ 500,000 Each Employee for Injury by Disease

\$ 500,000 Aggregate for Injury by Disease.

If the Contractor is a Sole Proprietor, Partnership or LLC, Insurance Policy and Certificate must indicate that the proprietor/partners/members are "included".

Umbrella Liability Insurance (Only applies if the General Liability General Aggregate applies per policy and no food or alcohol is served)

\$ 1,000,000 per Occurrence

\$ 1,000,000 Aggregate

The Umbrella shall provide additional limits in excess of the General Liability, Automobile Liability and Employers Liability policy limits listed above. The coverage will be at least as broad as the coverage provided in these policies.

Umbrella Liability Insurance (Only applies if food or alcohol is sold or served)

\$ 5,000,000 per Occurrence

\$ 5,000,000 Aggregate.

The Umbrella shall provide additional limits in excess of the General Liability, Automobile Liability and Employers Liability policy limits listed above. The coverage will be at least as broad as the coverage provided in these policies.

Property Insurance

Tenant shall insure their building or contents equal to their 100% Replacement Cost. Business Income insurance will be included for a limit equal to one (1) full season's income. In lieu of the requirements in this paragraph, the Tenant may sign a waiver of liability in favor of the City and NJDEP for all losses incurred to their building or contents including the loss of income.

Additional Insured Status and Certificate of Insurance.

The City and NJDEP, along with their respective elected or appointed officials, officers, agents and employees, shall be named as Additional Insureds on the Tenant's Commercial General Liability policy, Automobile Liability policy and Liquor Liability policy which must be primary and noncontributory with respect to the Additional Insureds.

It is expressly understood by the parties to this contract that it is the intent of the parties that any insurance obtained by the City or NJDEP is deemed excess, non-contributory and not co-primary in relation to the coverage(s) procured by the Tenant, any of its consultants, officers, agents, subcontractors, employees or anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of them or by anyone for whose acts any of the aforementioned may be liable by operation of statute, government regulation or applicable case law.

A Waiver of Subrogation Clause shall be added to the General Liability and Automobile policies in favor of the City and NJDEP and this clause shall apply to the City's and NJDEP's elected or appointed officials, officers, agents and employees with respect to all projects during the policy term. It should also apply to the Tenant's Workers' Compensation policy if allowed by state law.

Prior to Commencement of work, Tenant shall submit a Certificate of Insurance in favor of the City and NJDEP and an Additional Insured Endorsement (in a form acceptable to the City) as required hereunder.

No Limitation on Liability

In any and all claims against the Additional Insureds by any employee of the Tenant, anyone directly or indirectly employed by the Tenant or anyone for whose acts the Tenant may be liable, the indemnification obligation shall not be limited by any limitation on the amount or type of damage, compensation or benefits payable by or for the Tenant under workers' compensation acts, disability benefit acts or other employee benefit acts.

Insurance by Landlord and NJDEP

It is expressly understood by the parties to this contract that it is the intent of the parties that any insurance obtained by the City or NJDEP is deemed excess, non-contributory and not co-primary in relation to the coverage(s) procured by the Tenant, any of its consultants, officers, agents, subcontractors, employees or anyone directly or indirectly employed by any of them or by

anyone for whose acts any of the aforementioned may be liable by operation of statute, government regulation or applicable case law.

Waiver of Subrogation

A Waiver of Subrogation Clause shall be added to the General Liability and Automobile policies in favor of the City and NJDEP and this clause shall apply to the City's and NJDEP's elected or appointed officials, officers, agents and employees with respect to all projects during the policy term. It should also apply to the Tenant's Workers' Compensation policy if allowed by state law.

Prior to commencement of work, Tenant shall submit a Certificate of Insurance in favor of the City and NJDEP and an Additional Insured Endorsement (in a form acceptable to the City) as required hereunder.

Cancellation, Renewal and Modification

The Tenant shall maintain in effect all insurance coverages required under this section at the Tenant's sole expense. The policies shall contain a provision that coverage will not be cancelled, not renewed, or materially changed until at least ninety (90) days prior written notice has been given to the City. Certificate of insurance showing the required coverage to be in force must be delivered to the City prior to the occupancy of the leased premises. In the event the Tenant fails to obtain or maintain any insurance coverage required under this Section, the City may, at its sole discretion, purchase such coverage as desired for the City's benefit and charge the expense to the Tenant, or, in the alternative, terminate this agreement.

12. Additional Use Limitations. The Tenant shall not occupy or use the Leased Beach or any part thereof, nor permit or suffer the same to be occupied or used for any purposes other than as provided in this Lease, nor for any purpose deemed unlawful, disreputable, or hazardous. Use of lands by the Tenant in a protected sand dunes area is subject to Atlantic City Ordinance No. 22 of 1989, as amended. The City also reserves the right to allow the Army Corp of Engineers to stage equipment for beach replenishment wherever and whenever necessary to accommodate their project.

13. Compliance with Green Acres Program. The Leased parcels are owned and operated by the City of Atlantic City subject to the rules and requirements of the New Jersey Department of Environmental Protection (NJDEP), Green Acres Program including but not limited to N.J.A.C. 7-36. Failure to use the leased property in accordance with the requirements of the NJDEP Green Acres Program shall constitute grounds for termination of the Lease.

14. Eminent Domain. If the Leased Beach or any portion thereof, shall be taken under eminent domain or condemnation proceedings or if suit or other action shall be instituted for the taking or condemnation thereof, or if in lieu of any formal condemnation proceedings or actions, the Landlord shall grant an option to purchase and/or shall sell and convey the said premises or any portion thereof, to any other governmental or other public authority, agency, body or public utility, pursuant to a condemnation proceeding, then this Lease, at the option of the Landlord, shall terminate, and the term hereof shall end as of such date as the Landlord shall fix by notice in writing. The Tenant shall have no claim or right to claim or be entitled to any portion of any amount which may be awarded as damages or paid as the result of such condemnation proceedings or paid as the purchase price for such option, sale or conveyance in lieu of formal condemnation proceedings; and all rights to the Tenant to damages, if any, are hereby assigned to the Landlord. The Tenant agrees to execute and deliver any instruments, at the expense of the Landlord, as may be deemed necessary or required to expedite any condemnation proceedings or to effectuate a proper transfer of title to such entity seeking to take or acquire the Leased Beach or any portion thereof. The Tenant covenants and agrees to vacate the Leased Beach, remove all the Tenant's personal property there from and deliver up to such other party designated by the Landlord in the aforementioned notice. Failure by the Tenant to comply with any provisions in this clause shall subject the Tenant to such costs, expenses, damages and losses as the Landlord may incur by reason of the Tenant's breach hereof.

15. Landlord's Right to Cure. If the Tenant shall fail or refuse to comply with and perform any conditions and covenants of this Lease, the Landlord may, if the Landlord so elects, carry out and perform such conditions and covenants, at the cost and expense of the Tenant. Said cost and expense shall be payable on demand, or at the option of the Landlord, shall be added to the rental payment due immediately thereafter but in no case later than one month after such demand, whichever occurs sooner. This remedy shall be in addition to such other remedies as the Landlord may have hereunder by reason of the breach by the Tenant of any of the covenants and conditions in this Lease.

16. Landlord's Right to Inspect. The Tenant agrees that the Landlord and the Landlord's agents, employees or other representatives, shall have the right to enter into and upon the Leased Beach or any part thereof, at all reasonable hours, for the purpose of examining same, inspecting any operations thereon, and making such repairs or alterations as may be necessary for the safety and preservation of the leasehold. This clause shall not be deemed to be a covenant by the Landlord nor be construed to create an obligation on the part of the Landlord to make such inspection or repairs. Nothing in this lease shall preclude the right of inspection by the NJDEP Green Acres Program.

17. Removal of Tenant's Property. Any equipment, fixtures, goods or other property of the Tenant, not removed by the Tenant upon the termination of this Lease, or upon any quitting, vacating or abandonment of the Leased Beach by the Tenant, or upon the Tenant's eviction, shall be considered as abandoned and the Landlord shall have the right, without any notice to the Tenant, to sell or otherwise dispose of same, at the expense of the Tenant, and shall not be accountable to the Tenant for any part of the proceeds of such sale, if any.

18. Landlord's Right of Re-Entry. If there should occur any default on the part of the Tenant in the performance of any conditions and covenants herein contained, or should the Tenant be evicted by summary proceedings or otherwise, the Landlord, in addition to any other remedies herein contained or as may be permitted by law, may either by force or otherwise, without being liable for prosecution therefore, or for damages, re-enter the Leased Beach and take possession; and re-let the Leased Beach and receive the rents therefore and apply the rents to the payment of expenses, reasonable attorney fees and costs, alterations and repairs incurred as a result of re-entering and repossessing the Leased Beach and to the payment of the rents due hereunder. The Tenant shall remain liable for such rents as may be in arrears and also the rents as may accrue subsequent to the re-entry by the Landlord, to the extent of the difference between the rents reserved hereunder and the rents, if any, received by the Landlord during the remainder of the unexpired term hereof, after deducting the aforementioned expenses, fees and costs; the same to be paid as such deficiencies arise and are ascertained each month.

19. Landlord's Right to Terminate Lease. Upon the occurrence of any of the contingencies set forth in the preceding Paragraph, or should the Tenant be adjudicated bankrupt, insolvent or placed in receivership, or should proceedings be instituted by or against the Tenant for agreement of composition or assignment for the benefit of creditors, or if this Lease or the estate of the Tenant hereunder shall pass to another by virtue of any court proceedings, writ of execution, levy, sale, or by operation of law, the Landlord may, if the Landlord so elects, at any time thereafter, terminate this Lease and the term hereof, upon giving the Tenant five (5) day notice in writing of the Landlord's intention so to do. Upon the giving of such notice, this Lease shall end on the date fixed in such notice and the Landlord shall have the right to remove all persons, goods, fixtures and chattels there from, by force or otherwise, without liability for damages.

20. Limitation of Landlord's Liability. The Landlord and NJDEP shall not be liable for any damage or injury which may be sustained by the Tenant or any other person, as a consequence of the use and occupancy of the Leased Beach.

21. Landlord's Rights and Remedies Cumulative. The various rights, remedies, options and elections of the Landlord, expressed herein, are cumulative, and the failure of the Landlord to enforce strict performance by the Tenant of the conditions and covenants of this lease or have recourse to any remedy herein conferred or the acceptance by the Landlord of any installment of rent after any breach by the Tenant, shall not be deemed as a waiver or a relinquishment of any such conditions and covenants, options, elections or remedies, but the same shall continue in full force and effect. Further, should the Tenant be in default of any terms of this Lease, the City shall have the right to terminate this Lease upon (30) day notice to the Tenant unless tenant cures such default in a thirty-day (30) period.

22. Tenant's Obligations Not to Abate. This Lease and the obligation of the Tenant to pay the rent hereunder and to comply with the covenants and conditions hereof, shall not be affected, impaired or excused because of the Landlord's inability to supply any service or material called for herein, by reason of any rule, order, regulation or preemption by any governmental entity, authority, department, agency or subdivision or for any delay which may arise by reason of negotiations for the adjustment of any fire or other casualty loss or because of strikes or other labor trouble or for any cause beyond the control of the Landlord.

Notwithstanding the above, if, in the opinion of the Landlord's Business Administrator in consultation with the Chief of the Beach Patrol, the sand on the Leased Beach has eroded so significantly between the southerly line of the dune and the water's edge as to make that area substantially unusable at high tide, then the Rent payment for the lease year so determined shall be abated and not due from Tenant for that year. Said determination, if appropriate, shall be made prior to the payment due date for each lease year.

23. Provisions Severable. The terms, conditions, covenants and provisions of this Lease shall be deemed to be severable. If any clause or provision herein contained shall be adjudged to be invalid or unenforceable by a court of competent jurisdiction or by operation of any applicable law, it shall not affect the validity of any other clause or provision herein, but such other clauses or provisions shall remain in full force and effect.

24. Notices. All notices required under the terms of this Lease shall be complete upon the mailing of such notices by certified or registered mail, return receipt requested, to the mailing address set forth above. If the party's mailing address is different from its physical address, the mailing address shall be used unless it becomes necessary to serve the party at its physical address, or to such other address as such party may designate in writing, which notice of change of address shall be given in the same manner.

25. Landlord's Covenants; Quiet Enjoyment. The Landlord covenants and represents that the Landlord is the owner of the Leased Beach and has the right and authority to enter into, execute and deliver this lease; and does further covenant that the Tenant on paying the rent and performing the conditions and covenants herein contained, shall and may peaceably and quietly have, hold and enjoy the Leased Beach for the term of the lease. This use of the Leased Beach or any portion thereof, except for any portion upon which is located any built-in place food and beverage operation, cabana or other structure of the Tenant, is subject to suspension for any one (1) week per year upon thirty (30) days written notice to the Tenant for the purpose of scheduling certain large-scale events on the beach such as, but not limited to, concerts and athletic events.

26. Entire Contract; Modifications to be in Writing. This Lease contains the entire contract between the parties. No representative, agent, or employee of the Landlord has been authorized to make any representations or promises with reference to the within letting or to

vary, alter or modify the terms hereof. No additions, changes or modifications, renewals or extensions hereof, shall be binding unless reduced to writing and signed by the Landlord and the Tenant.

27. Tenant's Waiver of Subrogation. The Tenant waives all rights of recovery against the Landlord or Landlord's agents, employees or other representatives, for any loss, damages or injury of any nature whatsoever to property or persons for which the Tenant is insured unless barred by state law. The Tenant shall obtain from Tenant's insurance carriers and will deliver to the Landlord, waivers of the subrogation rights under the respective policies.

28. Conformance of Invalidated Provisions. The Landlord may pursue the relief or remedy sought in any invalid clause, by conforming the said clause with the provisions of the statutes or the regulations of any governmental agency in such case made and provided as if the particular provisions of the applicable statutes or regulations were set forth herein at length.

29. Number; Gender; Binding Agreement. In all references herein to any parties, persons, entities or corporation the use of any particular gender or the plural or singular number is intended to include the appropriate gender or number as the text of the within instrument may require. All the terms, covenants and conditions herein contained shall be for and shall inure to the benefit of and shall bind the respective parties hereto, and their heirs, executors, administrators, personal or legal representatives, successors and assigns.

30. Effective Date. The within Lease is effective as of the date of the Mayor's signature.

DISCLAIMER: PRIOR TO EXECUTION THE CITY OF ATLANTIC CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REVISE THIS AGREEMENT FOR ANY REASON

ATTEST:

CITY OF ATLANTIC CITY

Paula Geletei
PAULA GELETEI, CITY CLERK

BY: Marty Small, Sr.
MARTY SMALL, SR., MAYOR

DATE: 6/30/2025

ATTEST:

SHORE MANAGEMENT GROUP, INC

BY: _____
LARRY BELFER (Title)

DATE: _____

The within Lease approved as to form and execution.

Date: 5/29/2025

Jack A. Berenato
Jack A. Berenato, Assistant City Solicitor

DATE: _____

ATTEST: SHORE MANAGEMENT GROUP, INC

President

(Title)

BY: _____

LARRY BELFER

DATE: 4/25/25

The within Lease approved as to form and execution.

Date: _____

Jack A. Berenato, Assistant City Solicitor

Resolution of the City of Atlantic City

No. 444

Approved as to Form and Legality on Basis of Facts Set Forth

Factual contents certified to by

Assistant City Solicitor /s/ Jack Berenato

Director of Planning & Development/s/ Jacques Howard

Prepared by City Solicitor's Office

Council Members SHABAZZ, RANDOLPH, & LACCA present the following Resolution:

RESOLUTION TO ACCEPT HIGH BIDS SUBMITTED AT BEACH CONCESSION AUCTION HELD ON APRIL 03, 2025

WHEREAS, pursuant to Resolution No. 179 of 2025 adopted by the Council of the City of Atlantic City on March 19, 2025, authorization was given to offer for lease at public auction the beach concessions described as;

BEACH LOTS (4 year lease) MINIMUM BID (Each Lot)

LOT	STREET	Min Bid for 4 Year Lease
1	Jackson to mid Montgomery	\$2,000.00
2	Mid Montgomery to Berkley	\$2000.00
3	Berkley to Bartram	\$2,000.00
4	Bartram to Delancy	\$2,000.00
5	Delancy to Richmond	\$2,000.00
6	Richmond to Annapolis	\$2,000.00
7	Annapolis to Dover	\$2,000.00
8	Dover to Seedorf	\$2,000.00
9	Seedorf to Lincoln	\$2,000.00
10	Lincoln to Roosevelt	\$2,000.00
11	Roosevelt to Albany	\$2,000.00
12	Albany to Hartford	\$4,000.00
13	Hartford to Providence	\$4,000.00
16	Sovereign to Montpelier	\$4,000.00
23	Mid-Bellevue to Georgia	\$4,000.00
41	Vermont to New Hampshire	\$2,000.00
42	New Hampshire to Jetty (Maine)	\$2,000.00

WHEREAS, on April 03, 2025, at 11:00 a.m., the said beach concession areas were offered for sale at public auction; and

WHEREAS, on April 03rd, 2025, at 11:00 a.m. the following entities or their assignors were the highest bidders for leases for the specified concession area:

<u>Beach Lot</u>	<u>High Bid</u>	<u>High Bidder</u>
Lot 1	No Bid	
Lot 2	No Bid	
Lot 3	No Bid	
Lot 4	No Bid	
Lot 5	No Bid	
Lot 6	No Bid	
Lot 7	No Bid	
Lot 8	No Bid	
Lot 9	No Bid	
Lot 10	No Bid	
Lot 11	No Bid	
Lot 12	\$2,000.00	Shore Management Group, Inc.
Lot 13	No Bid	
Lot 16	\$4,000.00	Shore Management Group, Inc.
Lot 23	\$4,000.00	Shore Management Group Inc.
Lot 41	No Bid	
Lot 42	No Bid	

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Atlantic City that the high bid submitted as shown above for the lot listed and shown on the attached map, under the conditions enumerated in Resolution 179 of 2025, are hereby accepted; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Mayor is hereby authorized to execute and the City Clerk to attest to a lease, substantially in the form approved by the City Solicitor from the City of Atlantic City to the successful bidder, its assignee or designee, for the lots shown and for the above stated consideration; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the successful bidders shall be responsible for all applicable approvals necessary under Federal, State and local law.

June 23, 2025 4:20 PM

DO NOT USE SPACE BELOW THIS LINE													
RECORD OF COUNCIL VOTE ON FINAL PASSAGE													
COUNCIL MEMBER	AYE	NAY	N.V.	A.B.	MOT.	SEC.	COUNCIL MEMBER	AYE	NAY	N.V.	A.B.	MOT.	SEC.
BAILEY	X						LACCA				X		
CROUCH	X						MARSHALL	X					
DUNSTON	X						SHABAZZ	X				X	
KURTZ	X					X	TIBBITT	X					
RANDOLPH, PRESIDENT								X					
X-Indicates Vote NV-Not Voting AB-Absent MOT-Motion SEC-Second													

This is a Certified True copy of the Original Resolution on file in the City Clerk's Office.

DATE OF ADOPTION: JUNE 18, 2025

Paula Geletei

/s/ Paula Geletei, City Clerk